HANCOCK COUNTY SCHOOLS
SPRING SPORTS BID
2021-2022

PXZRYL_ KY Worth 679.50 NO B|d 699.50 Bid different brand NO Bld Bid Different Brand
Softballs (DZ) (10D2) 942.30 690.00
Easton Ghost Bat 33 oz.

— 23 inch No Bid No Bid No Bid 328.17 No Bid No bid

Easton M10 Catchers Set Alt-Mizuno Samurai
— Red/ Gray No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 236.00 No Bid

Spalding TF ProHS
(41-100HRS)

699.50 No Bid 709.50 842.60 No Bid 670.00
(10DZ) (10DZ) (10D2)

Wilson A1010 3 Dz.
Buckets No Bid No Bid 752.85 No Bid No Bid 414.00 (3DZ2)




HANCOCK COUNTY SCHOOLS
SPRING SPORTS BID

2021-2022
DESCRIPTION MOJO MEDCO BUMBLEBEE | BSN RIDDELL/ PYRAMID SCHOOL
SPORTS SPORTS SPORTS ALL AMERICAN | PRODUCTS
MEDICINE
Tennis — HCHS
Penn Championship
Extra Duty Tennis balls No Bid No Bid No Bid 86.88 No Bid 73.20
(case) Case Per case
BASKETBALL-MS
Mesh Reversible Practice
Jersey No Bid No Bid 12.50 No Bid 9.20 No Bid
Red-white- Numbered
on back of one color
Towels — Red or White 16.95
No Bid No Bid No Bid White No Bid White
21.36DZ 20"x40"
Plastic whistles (per dz) No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.46DZ 5.30 5.88
Lanyards for whistles
No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.31DZ 7.35 5.40 DZ




HANCOCK COUNTY SCHOOLS

SPRING SPORTS BID

2021-2022

DESCRIPTION MOJO MEDCO BUMBLEBEE | BSN RIDDELL/ PYRAMID SCHOOL

SPORTS SPORTS SPORTS ALL AMERICAN | PRODUCTS

MEDICINE
Mark V Basketball
Scorebooks 6.00 4.93 7.95 4.76 EA 4.88 6.79
Heavy Duty Hand Pump No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.27 No Bid 2.99
Basketball Clipboard
with Court Design No Bid No Bid 16.00 21.26EA No Bid 7.99
Slipknot mat refill pack
No Bid 30.12 43.95 43.97 EA 56.55 No Bid
Sm 17842
Spalding Men’s KHSAA
Basketball- 29.5 52.95 No Bid 56.00 62.38 No Bid 50.99
Spalding Women's
KHSAA Basketball- 28.5 52.95 No Bid 56.00 62.38 50.99
No Bid
Muller Sports Kit No Bid 134.14 No Bid 200.16 No Bid No Bid
Ice Packs No Bid .68 No Bid 17.30 No Bid
Instant 6X8 16.18

Medical Replenish Kit No Bid No Bid No Bid 88.08 No Bid No Bid




HANCOCK COUNTY SCHOOLS

SPRING SPORTS BID

2021-2022
DESCRIPTION MOJO MEDCO BUMBLEBEE | BSN RIDDELL/ PYRAMID SCHOOL
SPORTS SPORTS SPORTS ALL AMERICAN | PRODUCTS
MEDICINE
Assorted Band-aids
1.26

No Bid MEDCO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Heavy Duty 12 Loop-
Braided Nylon Basketball No Bid No Bid 4.95 1.77EA No Bid 2.89 EA
Nets
Athletic Tape No Bid 33.05 No Bid 46.87 52.50 No Bid
Water Bottles No Bid 1.46 No Bid 1.56 2.40 2.39
ARCHERY — MCMS
Genesis Bows (Original)
for No Bid No Bid No Bid 174.08 No Bid No Bid
NASP
Bow Kits

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




HANCOCK COUNTY SCHOOLS
SPRING SPORTS BID

2021-2022
DESCRIPTION MOJO MEDCO BUMBLEBEE | BSN RIDDELL/ PYRAMID SCHOOL
SPORTS SPORTS SPORTS ALL AMERICAN | PRODUCTS
MEDICINE

NASP grade arrows per No Bid No Bid No Bid 169.02 No Bid No Bid
dozen 72 PK
Vanes (NASP certified)

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Points ( NASP certified) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Adhesive

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cables and strings

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Block targets for NASP
(Bull's-eye Target) 80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
cm x 85 cm x34
Insert covers for NASP —
two sided covers — block No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
targets




HANCOCK COUNTY SCHOOLS

SPRING SPORTS BID

2021-2022

DESCRIPTION MOJO MEDCO BUMBLEBEE | BSN RIDDELL/ PYRAMID SCHOOL

SPORTS SPORTS SPORTS ALL AMERICAN | PRODUCTS

MEDICINE
Bow wax
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

80 cm Bulleye Paper
Targets No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BSN Sports — Bid #

Riddell — Bid # 136348

Pyramid School Products — Bid #20921HAN

Morrell-




